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In the greater Sydney area, no one does a better job of installing Lumex Opening Roof than
Highlands Blinds, Shutters & Awnings. We are a locally owned and run company that
supplies and instals high-quality window coverings like blinds, shutters, and awnings at
prices you'll appreciate. When it comes to customer service, we take great pride in the fact
that we have been in business for over 30 years and have a perfect track record of happy
clients.
From the first consultation and estimate to the final delivery and set-up, our seasoned pros
will be there every step of the way. For this reason, our wares are built to last under the
unforgiving rays of the Australian sun and in the damp, cold climate of the interior. Choose
from the hand-cranked, motorised, or fully automated variety. They are user-friendly and
cost-effective since we made sure of that. We are familiar with installing Lumex products and
will help you get your new Lumex opening roof set up so it looks amazing and functions as
intended.



If you live in Sydney, a Lumex opening roof is a great
investment.

Lumex Opening Roofs Sydney is the perfect choice for anyone looking to update their
outdoor living area because it allows for more light and ventilation. This is the ideal choice
for you if you want to enjoy your outside space throughout the entire year, regardless of the
temperature or precipitation levels that may be present. It is a solution for autonomous
outdoor louvred motorised shading that can simply be adjusted to accommodate the different
seasons. Your home's value will increase as a result of its adaptability, usability, capacity to
be controlled remotely, energy efficiency, durability, lifespan, and aluminium reinforcement
features.

Full command is maintained at all times because to the rigidity and wider spans that are
made possible by the design of the aluminium blades. Lumex opening roofs have a powder
coating finish that is guaranteed for 10 years, further reinforcing their position as the premier
opening roof solution for increased outdoor living. The colour fastness of the powder coating
finish is also guaranteed. Not only may it assist you in lowering the amount of money you
spend on your regular energy bills, but it can do so in a very efficient fashion as well.



What Makes Us the Best Option for Your Lumex Opening Roof
in Sydney?

We at Highlands Blinds, Shutters & Awnings are proud to provide Lumex Opening Roof
Sydney solutions that are not only effective but also convenient. We are dually licenced as a
Contractor and a Supervisor. We have over 30 years of experience serving Sydney and the
surrounding area, giving us the depth of knowledge and skill to provide you with
comprehensive solutions.

Measure and quotation, supply and installation, and after-sales service and support are just
few of the many services we provide to our customers. We take great pride in going above
and above for our customers and in the quality of our work.

The variety of products we have allows us to cater to customers with varying levels of
disposable income and aesthetic preferences. We apply the same level of skill and precision
to both indoor and outdoor items. In addition to improving your quality of life, we also
guarantee that your new installations will last the test of time and look great for years to
come.


